insurancegima@_gmail.com

From: insurancegima@gmail.com

Sent: 03 March 2023 18:33

To: ‘Sham (Jainuine Insurance)'

Cc: 'Kailash Jain'; ‘claim Service'; 'rhgandhi@gimatex.co.in’; ‘vineet@gimatex.co.in'
Subject: RE: Discharge Voucher for Fire Claim A/c. GIMATEX INDUSTRIES PVT. LTD
Attachments: BOB CANCEL CHEQUE.PDF; DISCHARGE PAYMENT VOUCHER 20230303_0001.pdf

Respected sir,

Pl. read amount of Rs.18,45,50,140/- instead of Rs. 15,45,50,140/-.

e,

From: insurancegima@gmail.com [mailto:insurancegima@gmail.com]

Sent: 03 March 2023 18:27

To: 'Sham (Jainuine Insurance)'

Cc: 'Kailash Jain'; 'claim Service'; 'rhgandhi@gimatex.co.in'; 'vineet@gimatex.co.in'
Subject: RE: Discharge Voucher for Fire Claim A/c. GIMATEX INDUSTRIES PVT. LTD

Respected Sir,

We are sending herewith attached Payment discharge voucher of Rs.15,45,50,140/- duly sign of our Chairman along
with cancel cheque of Bank of Baroda.

Thanks & Regards,
Suresh Hulke

For Gimatex Industries Pvt.Ltd. Cg_’ﬂd OSQOQ . (}%A/? ;W @7!’1’}{’,%}#‘ \[014 d’\f‘f

Hinganghat.

From: Sham (Jainuiine Insurance) [nmilto:sham@iainuinefnsurance,co.'rrﬁ SCMN\ Cﬁp\i a‘% CQ\@LC——’

Sent: 03 March 2023 17:56

To: insurancegima@gmail.com

Cc: Kailash Jain; claim Service

Subject: Discharge Voucher for Fire Claim A/c. GIMATEX INDUSTRIES PVT. LTD

Dear sir,
kindly find attached Discharge Voucher.

Thanks & Regards

Shyam Ambhore —
(Executive Officer)

Jainuine Insurance Brokers Pvt. Ltd.
AURANGABAD BUSINESS CENTRE (ABC WEST),
BLOCK NO. E-5, LEVEL 4, OPP. DISTRICT COURT,

ADALAT ROAD, AURANGABAD- 431001
MOB NO. 8888849450/ 8888559300



msurancegima@gmail.com

From: insurancegima@gmail.com
Sent: 03 March 2023 18:27
To: ‘Sham (Jainuine Insurance)'
Cc: ‘Kailash Jain'; 'claim Service'; 'rhgandhi@gimatex.co.in': 'vVineet@gimatex.co.in'
Subject: RE: Discharge Voucher for Fire Claim A/c. GIMATEX INDUSTRIES PVT. LTD
© Attachments: BOB CANCEL CHEQUE.PDF; DISCHARGE PAYMENT VOUCHER 20230303_0001.pdf

Respected Sir,

We are sending herewith attached Payment discharge voucher of Rs.15,45,50,140/- duly sign of our Chairman along
with cancel cheque of Bank of Baroda.

Thanks & Regards,

Suresh Hulke

For Gimatex Industries Pvt.Ltd.
Hinganghat.

From: Sham (Jainuine Insurance) [mailto:sham@jainuineinsurance.co.in)
Sent: 03 March 2023 17:56

To: insurancegima@gmail.com

Cc: Kailash Jain; claim Service

Subject: Discharge Voucher for Fire Claim A/c. GIMATEX INDUSTRIES PVT. LTD

Dear sir,
kindly find attached Discharge Voucher.

Thanks & Regards

Shyam Ambhore
(Executive Officer)
Jainuine Insurance Brokers Pvt. Ltd.

AURANGABAD BUSINESS CENTRE (ABC WEST),
BLOCK NO. E-5, LEVEL 4, OPP. DISTRICT COURT,
ADALAT ROAD, AURANGABAD- 431001

MOB NO. 8888849450/ 8888559300



MOTOR /MISC. CLAIM DEPARTMENT Form No: SPL-9 (1I)

THE NEW INDIA ASSURANCE CO.LTD.,
NON-SUIT CLAIM HUB - AURANGABAD(160002)
LIC BUILDING, PLOT NO: 3, N3, CIDCO : AUURANGABAD: 43100
PH NOS: 0240 - 2480715, 2482715

CLAIM SETTLEMENT VOUCHER

fntimated Loss No: Date of Payment :

Settle Loss No:

Disbursement No: Date ;

RECEIVED FROM THE NEW INDIA ASSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
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